
(O-2025-13

6 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

ORDINANCE NUMBER 0-

 21989

 

(NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE JUL 2 3 2025

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 11, ARTICLE 3,

DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY

AMENDING SECTION 113.0103; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,

ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 125.0431;

AMENDING CHAPTER 13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY

AMENDING SECTION 131.0322; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY RETITLING AND AMENDING

SECTION 141.0302; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 3,

DIVISION 8 BY AMENDING SECTION 143.0815; AND

AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 4, DIVISION 5 BY

AMENDING SECTION 144.0501, RELATING TO THE

AMENDMENT TO THE ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT AND

JUNIOR ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT REGULATIONS.

RECITALS

The Council of the City of San Diego (Council) adopts this Ordinance based on the following:

A. California Government Code sections 66310 through 66342 (State ADU Law)

require a local agency to either adopt an ordinance that permits state-required Accessory

Dwelling Units (ADU) and Junior Accessory Dwelling Units (JADU) by ministerial approval in

accordance with specified standards and conditions or approve applications for state-required

ADUs ministerially if a local ordinance is not adopted.

B. By Ordinance O-21254, the Council adopted an Accessory Dwelling Unit (ADU)

Bonus Program, establishing a program to incentivize and promote the creation of accessory

dwelling units that can be offered at affordable rent for very, low-, or moderate-income

households.

C. On October 11,2023, 

the California Governor approved

 Assembly Bill 434

(Grayson, 2023), which modified Government Code section 65585 to require enforcem

ent of

-PAGE 1 OF 38-

O

{

 

 

-4

,

 



(O-202

5-1

36 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

State ADU Law in local agency regulations by California Department of Housinš and

Community Development (HCD).

E. On October 30,2024, the City received comments.from HCD, which included

revisions to the City's ADU regulations needed to align with State ADU Law. The

comments addressed maximum ADU size, applicable zones, fire sprinklers, ADU

conversions, number of ADUs allowed on a lot, landscaping, floor area ratios, side yard

setbacks, replacement parking and JADU owner-occupancy requirements.

F. On March 4,2025, the Council requested that the City Planning Department

return to Council within 90 days with an ordinance to remove the applicability of RS-1-1,

RS-1-2, RS-1-3, RS-1-4, RS-1-8, RS-1-9, RS-1-10, and RS-1-11 base zones from the ADU

Density Bonus Program and bring forward additional revisions to the ADU Density Bonus

Program outlined in the City Planning Department's February 28,2025, memorandum to the

Land Use and Housing Committee.

G. The City Planning Department has prepared the ADU and JADU Regulation

Amendments to the San Diego Municipal Code and Local Coastal Program Amendment,

which proposes to comprehensively address concerns raised with respect to the ADU Home

Density Bonus Program, as well as to make other revisions to the City's ADU regulations

necessary to address HCD comments and align with State ADU Law, as well as to allow for

the separate sale of ADU homes as allowed by Assembly Bill 1033.

H. The California Building Standards Code (Title 24) authorizes local agencies to

enforce fire and life safety requirements where necessary to protect public health and safety,

including requirements related to fire separation, defensible space, and structure placement,

particularly in areas with elevated wildfire risk. This Ordinance requires ADU homes located

within High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones to maintain a minimum four-foot interior

-PAGE 2 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

side and rear yard setback to provide adequate defensible space between all structures on the

premises and adjacent native or naturalized vegetation, and ensures authority for the Fire Code

Official to require greater interior side or rear yard setbacks when necessary to ensure

compliance with the California Fire Code and to address specific site conditions related to fire

safety. This change is also intended to provide certainty for applicants at the beginning of the

development process.

I. Government Code section 51182 requires the creation of an ember-resistant zone

within five feet of a structure located in Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones, recognizing that

combustible materials within the immediate five feet of a structure contribute to the greatest risk

of embers directly or indirectly igniting the home. In addition, Assembly Bill 3074, approved by

the Governor in 2020, directs the State Board of Forestry to adopt regulations known as

"Zone 0", which will require an ember-resistance zone within five feet of structures in

California's highest fire severity zones.

J. The ADU Home Density Bonus Program currently applies in all zones that allow

residential uses, which can result in ADU developments constructed through this program that

can be out of scale with the surrounding neighborhood. This Ordinance prohibits the application

ofthe ADU Home Density Bonus Program in the following residential zones: RS1-1, RS-1-2,

RS-1-3, RS-1-4, RS-1-8, RS-1-9, RS-1-10, and RS-1-11, unless the portion of the premises

proposed for development is located in an area identified as a High or Highest High or Highest

California Tax Credit Allocation Committee (CTCAC) Opportunity Area at the time the

development application is deemed complete and is in an area identified as residential in a land

use plan. These zones have a minimum lot size requirement of 10,000 square feet or greater with

the purpose of providing development regulations to implement land use plan designations with

very low densities and were not intended to be developed with significant new densities absent

-PAGE 3 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

furthe

r rezo

ning actio

ns. In ad

ditio

n, this

 provi

sion af

firmatively

 furt

hers fa

ir ho

using

 by

ensurin

g that n

eighb

orho

ods with the g

reatest

 acces

s to e

conom

ic opp

ortunit

y remain eligibl

e for

the ADU Home Density

 Bonus Prog

ram.

K. 

The ADU Bonus Pr

ogram does

 not 

curren

tly inc

lude

 requi

rements re

late

d to

emergen

cy eva

cuatio

n in High and Very High Fire Hazard

 Sever

ity Zones

. This Ordin

ance

require

s lots o

therwise eli

gible fo

r the A

DU Home Density

 Bonus Progr

am in High or Very

High Fire Hazard 

Severi

ty Zones 

to be on

 an improve

d publ

ic str

eet w

ith at lea

st two eva

cuatio

n

routes, 

and prohib

its the 

program

 on lot

s in High and Very H

igh Fire Hazard Se

verity

 Zones tha

t

front a 

cul-de-s

ac or h

ave on

ly one p

oint of ingre

ss or 

egress i

n order

 to better

 ensure a

dequate

emergenc

y access

 and evacu

ation sa

fety for A

DU homes pe

rmitted unde

r the P

rogra

m.

L. 

The ADU Bonus Prog

ram does 

not ha

ve req

uirements to

 determ

ine th

e

develo

pable a

rea on singl

e family zone

d lots t

o ensu

re the

 develo

pment is a

ppropri

ately

 scale

d to

the sur

roundin

g area, 

and th

ere are 

instance

s where lar

ger deve

lopable 

lots or 

lots tha

t con

tain

undev

elopab

le envi

ronm

entally

 sensiti

ve lan

ds can lead

 to de

velopm

ent th

at was no

t cons

istent

with the pu

rpose 

of the lo

wer den

sity zones

 und

er the 

existing

 program

. This O

rdinan

ce requ

ires

ADU Home Density

 Bonus Prog

ram project

s on lots 

that o

nly perm

it singl

e family homes an

d

exceed

 the m

inimum base

 zone 

lot size

 to ha

ve the

ir flo

or are

a ratio 

(FAR) cap

ped at 8,

000

square 

feet, a

nd if the lo

t contai

ns envir

onmentally

 sensitive 

lands,

 the FAR would be c

alculate

d

using only the portio

n of the lot 

that d

oes not

 contai

n enviro

nmentally se

nsitive

 lands

, using a

maximum lot area

 of 8,000 

square f

eet. In

 additio

n, this O

rdinance

 sets a maximum ADU cap

based

 on the lo

t squa

re foo

tage. This req

uirem

ent is

 inten

ded to ens

ure ADU deve

lopment 

is

similar in s

cale to 

the sur

roundin

g neig

hborho

od.

M. 

This O

rdina

nce i

ncre

ases 

the pen

alty for 

viol

ation

s of

 the 

deed re

strict

ion on

afford

able ADU hom

es pe

rmitted

 unde

r the A

DU Home Densit

y Bonus Pro

gram to 

ensure th

e

-PAGE 4 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

homes remain available

 to qualifyi

ng households,

 aligning with the prog

ram's intent 

of

increasing

 affordab

le housing opportun

ities.

N. ADUs permitted through the ADU Home Density Bonus Program should - in

exchange for the 

allowance of additional ADUs - contribute toward neighborh

ood

enhancements. This Ordinance requ

ires applican

ts opting into the A

DU Home Density Bonus

Program to pay an ADU Home Density Bonus Program Community Enhancement Fee f

or all

affordable

 and bonus ADUs under 750 

square fee

t to be eligible

 for this opt-i

n bonus program

.

0. The Office of

 the City Attorney prepare

d this Ordinance based 

on the 

inform

ation

provided by City staff (including

 information provided by affected

 third parties

 and verified

 by

City staff),

 with the und

erstandin

g that this

 information is

 complete an

d accura

te.

ACTION ITEMS

Be it ordained

 by the Council of the City of San Diego:

Section 1.

 

Chapter 11

, Article 3, Division 1 of the S

an Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending sectio

n 113.0103, to read as f

ollows:

§113.0103

 

Definitions

Abutting property through Accessory b

uilding 4 change

 in text.

Accesso

 Dweling Unit (AD) means an attach

ed or detach

ed residenti

al

dwelling unit

 

that pro

vides co

mplete ind

ependen

t livin

g facilit

ies for 

one or m

ore

persons includin

g permanent p

rovision

s for livin

g, sleepin

g, eatin

g, cookin

g, and

sanitation

, and is loca

ted on the sam

e premises as t

he propo

sed or exi

sting single

dwelling unit or multiple dwelling unit.

Access

ory struc

ture through Surface Mining N

o change in text.

1

Sustainable Development

 Area 

means the

 area within

 a defined

 walking

 distanc

e

along a

 pedestri

an path o

 f travel us

ing sidew

alks from a

 

major tran

sit stop

 that is

-PAGE 5 OF 38-

r
f



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

existing or planned, if the planned major transit stop is included in a

transportation improvement program or applicable regional transportation plan, as

follows:

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Within Mobility Zone 4, as defined in Section 143.1103, the defined

walking distance is 0.75 mile.

(c) [No change in text.]

In addition, an adopted specific plan prepared in accordance with Section

122.0107(a), shall be within the

 

Sustainable Development

 Area if the Sustainable

Development

 

Area is within a portion of the adopted specific plan.

Target population

 

through Yard

 [No change in text.

.

1

Section 2.

 

Chapter 12, Article 5, Division 4 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 125.0431, to read as follows:

§125.0431

 

Additional Notice for a Condominium Conversion Map

() For

 

a tentative map for a condominium conversion project, the subdivider

shall provide the following notices in addition to the notice provided for in

Chapter 11, Article 2, Division 3 (Notice):

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Notice to each person applying for the rental of a dweHing unit or

Accessory Dwelling Unit in the proposed project required in

Chapter 11, Article 2, Division 3 (Notice) and Subdivision Map Act

section 66452.17;

(3) through (5) [No change in text.]

(b) through (c) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 6 OF 38-



(O-2025-

136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

Section 3. 

Chapter 13,

 Article 1, 

Division 3 of

the San Diego Municipa

l Code is

amended by amending sec

tion 131.0322, to

 read as follows:

§131.0322 Use Regulations Table for Agricultural

 Zones

The uses allow

ed in the agricu

ltural zon

es are show

n in Table 131.03B.

Legend for T

able

 131-03B

[No change in text.-]

Table 131-03B

Use Regulation

s Table fo

r Agricultural 

Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

[See Sect

ion 131.0112 for an

 explanat

ion and

descriptions of the Use Categories,

Subcategories, and 

Separately Regulated

Uses]

Zone

 Zones

Designator

1 st & 2nd

 AG AR

>>

3rd >> 1- 1-

4th >> 1

 2 1 2

Open Space

 through Residential, S

eparately R

egulated

Residential Uses, Interim Ground Floor Residential [No

change in text.]

Junior Accessory Dwelling Uni

ts

[No change in text.-]

L [No chang

e

in text.]

Residential,

 Separately

 Regulated Residential U

ses,

Live/Work Quarters through Signs, Separately Regulated

Signs

 

Use, Theater

 

Marquees

 

change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Footnotes for Table 131-03B

' through 3 [No change in text.]

Section 4.

 

Chapter 14, Article 1, Division 3 of the San

 Diego Municipal C

ode is

amended by amending secti

on 141.0302, to read as f

ollows:

§141.0302

 

Accessory 

Dwelling Units (ADUs) and Junior 

Accessory

 Dwelling Units

JADUs)

Accesso

ry Dwelling U

nits (ADUs and Junior Accessor

y Dwelling

 Units 

ADUs

are perm

itted as a 

limited use decid

ed in accordan

ce with Process

 One, ind

icated

-PAGE 7 OF 38-



(O-202

5-13

6 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

with an "L" in the Use Regulations Tables in Chapter 13, Article 1 (Base Zones),

subject t

o the fo

llowing regula

tions.

(a) Regulations for ADUs and JADUs.

(1) Guest Quarters. Guest qua

rters and

 non-habita

ble accesso

ry

structures

 

shall be permitted in addition to

 

ADUs and JADUs, if

permitted by the base zone.

(2) Development Impact Fees. Development Impact Fees

 for ADUs

and JADUs shall be

 paid in a

ccordanc

e with Section

 142.06

40(b).

(3) Multi-Dwelling Unit and

 Urban Lot Split

 Regulation

s.

 An ADU or

JADU shall not be p

ermitted to be constructed on any premises

that has

 utiliz

ed the pr

ovision

s of Chapter 1

4, Article 3

, Division

13, Multi-Dwelling Unit and U

rban Lot Sp

lit Regulat

ions for

Single Fam

ily Zones, exce

pt as prov

ided in Sec

tion

143.1305(c)(1).

(4) Previously Conforming. Construction

 ofànADUor JADUshall

not requ

ire correc

tion ofpreviou

sly conforming condition

s on the

premises.

(5) Conversion.

 

An ADU or JADU that is

 

converte

d from an exist

ing

dwelling unit or acc

essoy structure, o

r is constru

cted in the same

location and w

ithin the same

 

building envelope as an

 

existing

dwelüng unit or ac

cessory structur

e, may continu

e to observe the

same setback

s as t

he ex

isting

 

dwelling unit

 or accesso

ry structu

re

and they shall 

not be

 subjec

t to th

e setbac

k requir

ements in 

Section

141.0302(b)(9).

-PAGE 8 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(6) Fire Sprinklers.

(A) An ADU or JADU shall not be required to provide

automatic fire sprinklers if they are not required for the

primary dwelling unit.

(B) An ADU or JADU shall be required to provide an automatic

fire sprinkler system when located on

 

a premises

 

where the

primary dwelling unit is protected with an automatic fire

sprinkler system in accordance with the California Building

Standards Code.

(C) The construction of a detached ADU shall not trigger a

requirement for automatic fire sprinklers to be installed in

the existing primary

 

dwelling unit or multiple dwelling unit

unless required in accordance with the California Building

Standards Code.

(7) Within the Coastal Overlay Zone.

(A) An existing structure may only be converted or

reconstructed as an ADU or JADUifthe structure

conforms to all the following regulations:

(i) The

 wetland

 

regulations in Section 143.0141(b);

ii) The sensitive coastal bls regulations in Section

143.0143;

(iii)

 The coastal beaches 

regulations in Section

143.0144; and

-PAGE 9 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 

REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(iv)

 

The Supplemental Regulations of the Coastal

Overlay Zone in Section 132.0403.

() ADUs or JADUs

 constructed within areas o

f future sea

level rise s

hall comply with the regula

tions in Sectio

n

132.0404.

(C) ADUs or JADUs shall co

mply with all the fo

llowing

regulations:

(i) The

 

wetland

 

regulations in Section 143.0141(b);

ii)

 

The sensitiv

e coastal blufs

 

regulations in Section

143.0143;

(iii)

 The coastal beaches 

regulations in Section

143.0144; and

(iv)

 

The Supplemental Regulations of the Coastal

Overlay Zone in Section 132.0403.

(8) An ADU shall not

 be used

 for a ren

tal term of less

 than 31

consecuti

ve days. JADUs are no

t subject to

 rental te

rm limitations.

(b) ADU Developm

ent Regulatio

ns.

(1) On

 

a premises

 

with an existing or proposed single

 

dwelling unit,

the following is permitted:

(A) One ADU that is 

within an e

xisting or prop

osed singl

e

dwelling unit or

 

within an existing

 

accessor

y structur

e,

subject to 

the follow

ing:

(i) Construction

 

of the ADU may

 

expand the

 

gross

floor aeaof an

 

existing

 

accessory structure

 

up to

-PAGE 10 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 

REV.)

(COR. COPY)

150 square feet to only allow for ingress and egress;

and

(ii) The ADU shàll have a separate exterior entry from

the single dwelling unit.

(B) One attached or detached ADU

(2) The maximum number ofADUs on apremises with a proposed

multiple dwelling unit structure shall not exceed two detached

ADUs.

(3

) 

O

n

 

a premises

 

with an existing multiple dwelng unit structure, the

following applies:

(A) The maximum number of ADUs that may be permitted

within the existing non-livable space of an existing

 

multiple

dwelling unit structure shall not exceed 25 percent of the

total number of multiple dwelling units in the structure. The

minimum number of ADUs 

that may be permitted within the

non-livable space of the existing

 

structure is

 one. For

example, non-livable space includes, but is not limited to,

storage rooms, boiler rooms, passageways, attics, basements,

or garages; and

(B) A maximum of eight detached ADUs may be permitted on

the premises,

 

provided that the number of detached

 ADUs

shall not exceed the number of existing multle dwelling

units inthe multiple dwelling unit structure.

-PAGE 11 OF 38-



(O-2025-1

36 R

EV.)

(COR. COPY)

(4)

 

In accor

dance

 with Govern

ment Code sec

tion 66

321(b)(3), one

attached

 or detach

ed ADU with a grossßoor ar

ea of 800 squa

re

feet or 

less may be pe

rmitted in acco

rdance 

with Se

ctions 

-

141.0302(a)(1)-()(3), pro

vided th

at the dev

elopment r

esults i

n no

more than

 one attach

ed or detach

ed ADU on

 theprem

ises. The

ADU shall 

not be su

bject to maximum lot

 

coverage,

 

maximum

ßoor area

 ratio, a fro

nt yard

 setback

, and minimum open spac

e

requirem

ents of the unde

rlying base zo

ne.

(5) Lot Size. A minimum lot siz

e is not r

equired 

for the c

onstructio

n

of an

 ADU.

(6) Density. ADUs are no

t subject 

to the de

nsity limitations of the base

zone for the

 

premises.

(7 Gross Floor Area.

(A) The grossßoor area

 of an ADU shall no

t be less th

an 150

square feet.

(B) The grossß

oor area 

of an attac

hed or

 detache

d ADU shall

not exceed 

1,200 square

 feet.

(C) An ADUconstr

ucted within an 

existing or pr

opose

d single

dwelling unit st

ructure

 shall no

t have a

 maximum gross

jloor area

 

requirement.

(D) An ADU construc

ted w

ithin an exis

ting

 

accesso

ry struct

ure

on a single dwelling unit lot

 shall not hav

e a maximum

grossß

oor area

 requi

rement and

 may con

struct an

-PAGE 12 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. C

OPY

)

additional 150 squa

re feet to only allow for ingress and

egress.

(E) ADUs constructed within an existing multile

 

dwelling unit

structure

 shall not have a maximum 

gross jloor area

requirement.

(F) The gross#oor area of an ADU shall be included in the

floor area ratio for the premises.

(8) Height.

(A) On lots that pe

rmit single dwelling unit develo

pment but

not multiple dwelling unit development, detached ADU

structures shall not exceed two stories.

(B) On

 lots

 

that permit single dwelling unit development

 but not

multle dwelling unit development, ADUs attached to an

existing accessory structure shall not exceed two stories.

(C) ADUs šhall comply with the overall maximum structure

height of the underlying base zone and overlay zone.

(9) 

Setb

ack

s.

(A) The front yard setback of an ADU shall be consist

ent with

the base zone.

(B) The minimum street side yard setback of an ADU shall be

4 feet or the minimum 

street

 side

 

yard

 setback of the base

zone, whichever is less.

-PAGE 13 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(C) Interior side

 yard and

 

rear yard

 setbacks

 for ADU

stru

cture

s

 with a

 

structure heig

ht of 16 feet or

 

less shall be

 provided as follows:

i) For ADU structures

 

located on

 

a premises

 

out

sid

e

o f a High or Very High Fire Hazard Sever

ity Zone,

there is

 no minimum interior

 side yard and rear

yard

 

setbacks,

 

except

 that th

e Fire Code Official

may require a greater

 setback to ensure compliance

with the California Fire Code, California Code of

Regulations (CCR), Title 14, 

Section 

1276.01, and

the Inter

nationa

l Fire C

ode (IFC), incl

uding 

section

504.1.

(ii)

 For ADU structures 

locate

d on apr

emises 

within a

High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, the

minimum interior side 

yard and rear ya

rd setba

cks

shall be 4

 feet to provide

 defen

sible space 

between

all structures on

 the premises and contiguou

s areas

of native or n

aturalized

 vegetat

ion, except 

that the

Fire Code Official m

ay require

 a greater se

tback to

ensure

 compliance 

with the Califor

nia Fir

e Code,

Cali

 fornia C

ode of Regulation

s (CCR), Title 14,

Section 12

76.01, and the Inter

national Fire Code

(IFC), including section 504.1.

-PAGE 14 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(D) Interior side yard and rear yard setbacks for ADU

structures with a structure height that exceeds 16 feet shall

be provided as follows:

 

For ADU structu

res

 located on 

a premises

 outside

of a High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone,

there is no minimum interior side yard and rear

yard setbacks,

 

except that the Fire Code Official

may require a greater setback to ensure compliance

with the California Fire Code. However, if the side

or rear property line abuts another premises that is

residentially zoned or developed with exclusively

residential uses, the minimum interior side yard and

rear yard setbacks shall be 4 feet or the minimum

setback of the app

licable bas

e zone, whichev

er is

less, excep

t that the Fire Code Official may require

a greater

 setback

 to ensure co

mpliance with the

California Fire Code, California Code of

Regulations (CCR), Title 14, Section 1276.01, and

the International Fire Code (IFC), including section

504.1.

(ii) For ADUstructures

 located on a premises within a

High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity

 Zone, the

minimum interio

r side yard and rear yard setba

cks

shall be

 4 feet to

 provide def

ensible

 space between

-PAGE 15 OF 38-



(O-2025-1

36 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

all structures on the premises and any contiguous

areas o f native or naturalized vegetation or as

otherwise required, except that the Fire Code

Official may require a greater setback to ensure

compliance with the California Fire Code,

California Code of Regulations (CCR), Title 14,

Section 1276.01, and the International Fire Code

(IFC), including section 504.1.

(

1

0

)

 

Parking.

(A) No on-street parking spaces or ostreet parking spaces are

required for

 

ADUs,

 

except as specified in Section

141.0302(b)(10)(B).

(B) When an ADU is proposed on apremises located both

within the Beach Impact Area of the Parking Impact

Overlay Zone and outside of a transitpriority area, one

of-street parking space

 

located consistent with Section

141.0302(b)(10)(D) shall be required per ADU, unless any

of the following apply:

(i) The ADU is 500 square feet or less;

Ù

 

The premises is

 located within

 a historical district

høt is a designated historical resource

(iii)

 

The ADU is attached to the proposed or existing

primary dwelüng unit or

 

accessory structur,

-PAGE 16 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(iv)

 

The premises is located within a residential permit

parking district; or

(v) There is a car share vehicle located within one

block 

of the premises.

(C) When a garage, carport, or covered parking structure is

demolished in conjunction with the construction of an

ADU, or converte

d to an ADU, replacem

ent of those oß

street parking spaces is not required unless the premises is

located within the Beach Impact Area of the Parking

Impact Overlay Zone and outside of the transit priority

area, in which case parking shall be replaced in a location

consistent with Section 141.0302(b)(10)(D).

(D)

 

When an uncovered parking space is demolished in

conjunction with the construction of an

 

ADU, or

 converted

to an ADU, replacement of those o-street parking

spaces is not required.

(E) Ifoýstreetparking spaces are required in accordance with

Section 141.0302(b)(10)(B) or 141.0302(b)(10)(C), or if

the applicant chooses to provide ff-street parking spaces

for ADUs located on the

 

premises, the

 

following applies:

) Off-street parking spaces may be

 located within the

setback

 

areas, and may include tandem spaces or

mechanical lifts; and

-PAGE 17 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(ii)

 

Off-street parking spaces

 shall be located within

hardscape areas and shall comply with the

minimum standards and guidelines to provide safe

and efficient means of vehicular access to the lot.

-street parking spaces may not encroach into the

public right-of-way.

(F) Notwithstanding Section 141.0302(a)(4), ifthe construction

of an ADU 

causes an existing driveway curb cut to no

longer comply with the minimum

 

off-street parking spaces

dimensions required in Table 142-05K of Section

142.0560, the driveway shall be closed to the satisfaction of

the City Engineer.

(11) The record owner is not required to live on the same premises o f

an ADU.

Development Regulations for

 JADs.

(1) On a premises with an existing or proposed single dwelling unit,

one JADU is permitted, subject to the following:

(A) The JADU shall be within an existing or proposed single

dwelling unit or attached garage;

(B) Construction ofthe JADUmay expand the floor area ofthe

existing single dwelling unit up to 150 square feet to only

allow for ingress and egress;

(C) The JADU shall have a separate exterior entry from the

existing or proposed

 

single dwelling unit

-PAGE 18 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(D) The JADUmay not be sold or conveyed separately from

the primary

 

dwelling unit

(E) The

 

record owner 

of-the primary

 

dwelling unit

 shall reside

in the single dwelling unit or JADU, and

(F) Before a Building Permit may be issued for a JAD U the

record owner shall enter into an agreement with the City in

a form that is approved by the City Attorney that includes

the following provisions:

(i) The JADUmay notbe sold or conveyed separately

from the primary dweüing unit;

(ii) The agreement may be enforced against future

purchasers;

(iii)

 

The record owner shall reside on

 

the premises

(iv)

 

The agreement shall be recorded in the Office of the

County Recorder of San Diego County; and

(v) The agreement shall run with the land for the life of

the JADU

(G)

 

Government agencies, land trusts, and qualified housing

organizations are exempt from Section 141.0302(c)(1)(E)

and Section 141.0302(c)(1)(F).

(2) Lot Size. JADUs are not subject to a minimum lot size.

(3 Density. JADUs

 

are not subject to the density limitations for the

premises.

A) Gross Floor Area.

-PAGE 19 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(A) The grössßoor area of a JADU shall not be included in the

floor area ratio for fe premises.

(B) A JADU shall not be less than 150 square feet and shall not

exceed 500 square feet within an existing or proposed

single dwelling unit.

(5) Exterior Entry. A JADU shall have a separate exterior entry from

the primary dwelling unit.

(6) Kitchen. A JADU shall include the following:

(A) A cooking facility with appliances;

(B) A food preparation counter of a reasonable size in relation

to the size ofthe JADU; and

(C) Storage cabinets that are of a reasonable size in relation to

the size of the JADU.

(7) Parking.

(A) No on-street parking spaces or

 

of-street parking spaces are

required for a JADU.

(B) When an attached garage is converted to a JADU

replacement o f those oýstreet parking spaces is not

required unless the premises is located within the Beach

Impact Area of the Parking Impact Overlay Zone and

outside of a

 

transit priority area, m

 

which case parking

shall be replaced in a location consistent with Section

141.0302(c)(7)(C).

-PAGE 20 OF 38-



(O-202

5-136

 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(C) If o-street

 parking spaces 

are requi

red in acc

ordance with

Section 141.0302(c)(7)(B) or ifthe

 

applicant

 chooses to

- provide

 

off-street parking spaces for JADUs

 located on the

premises, the

 

following applies:

(i) Oýstreetparking spaces may be located within the

setback 

areas, an

d may incl

ude tand

em space

s or

mechanical lifts; and

(ii)

 

Off-street parking spaces

 shall be located within

hardscape

 

areas and sh

all comply with the

minimum standards and guidelin

es to provide s

afe

and efficient means of vehicular acc

ess to the lot.

Off-street parking spaces may not

 encroach into the

public right-of-way.

(D)

 

Notwithstanding S

ection 141.0302(a)(4), ifthe co

nstruction

of a JADU 

causes

 an exist

ing driv

eway curb

 cut to

 no

longer comply with the minimum

 

o-street

 parking space

dimensions required in Table 142-05K of Section

142.0560, t

he driveway shall be c

losed to the sa

tisfaction of

the City Engineer.

(d) ADU Home Density Bonus. In addition to the ADUs and

 14DUs permitted

under Sectio

ns 141.0302(b) and 141.0302(c), additional b

onus ADUs and

affordable

 ADUs

 

shall be permitted subject to the 

following:

(1) Location Requirements.

-PAGE 21 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(A) The portion of theprem

ises propos

ed for dev

elopment may

not be within the following base zone

s: RS-1-1, 

RS-1-2,

RS-1-3, RS-1-4, RS-1-8, RS-1-9, RS-1-10, or 

RS-1-11,

unless the following apply:

(i) The premises is in an area identified

 as a High or

Highest C

alifornia

 Tax Credit Allocation

Committee (C

TCAC) Opportun

ity Area when the

development

 

application is

 

deemed complete; and

(ii) Thepremises is identified as Residential in

 

a land

use plan.

(B) On

 

a premises

 

within the

 

Sustain

able Devel

opment Area

,

one additional bonus ADU shall be perm

itted for every

additional affordable ADU

(C) On apremises outside of the Sustainable Development

Area, a maximum of one bonus ADU and one affordable

ADU shall be permitted.

(D) When

 

a premises is

 

locate

d in more th

an one base 

zone,

only the portion

 

of the premises

 that meets the

requirements of Section

 141.0302(d)(1)(A) shall be 

eligible

for bonus ADUs and affordable ADUs as specified

 in

Sections 141.0302(d)(1)(B) or 141.0302(d)(1)(C).

(2) Lot Requirements.

(A) Within High and Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones,

the applicant

 shall demonstrate that the lot fronts an

-PAGE 22 OF 38-



(O-2025-1

36 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

improved public stree

t with at least two evacuatio

n routes

to the satisf

action ofthe F

ire Code Official; 

and

(B) Within High and Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones,

the lot

 shall not front a cul-de-sac or be located on a

premises

 

that only has one point of ingress or egress.

(3) Floor Area Ratio.

(A) Within a base zone that permits single dweing unit

developments but not multiple dwelling unit deve

lopments,

the maximumfloor area r

atio shall 

be determ

ined as

follows:

(i) Where the

 lot conta

ins enviro

nmentaüy sens

itive

lands, the

 maximum perm

ittedßoor a

rea rat

io shall

be determined using only the area

 of the lot

 that

does not contain environmentaUy sensitive lands;

(ii) In no case shall the maximum permittedßoor area

ratio be de

termined using more than 8,000 squ

are

feet for the lot area; and

(iii) For the RS-1-1, RS-1-2, RS-1-3, RS-1-4, RS-1-5,

RS-1-6

, RS-1-7 

base z

ones, the

 app

licable

ßoor

area ratio shall be determined in accordance with

Table 131-04J usin

g the adj

usted lot a

rea as

describ

ed in Sec

tions 141.0302

(d)(3)(A)(i) and

141.0302(d)(3)(A)(ii).

-PAGE 23 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(B) Within a base zone that permits multle dweing unit

developments where the lot contains environmentally

sensitive lands, the maximum permittedßoor area ratio

shall be determined by using the area of the lot that does

not contain environmentally sensitive lands.

(4) Total Maximum number ofpermitted ADUs and JADUs on single

dwelling unit lots. The total maximum number of ADUs and

JDUs that may be permitted on a lot within a base zone that

permits single dwelling unit development but not multiple dwelling

unit development,

 shall be based on the lot area in accordance with

Table 141-03A. Ifthe lot contains

 

environmentally sensitive lands,

the lot area

 

shall be determined using the area of the lot that does

not contai environmentally sensitive lands.

Table 141-03A

Maximum Number of Permitted DUs and

 

JADUs on Single

Dweing Unit Lots

Lot Area

 

Maximum Number

 

of ADUs

(square feet)

 

and JADUs

8,000 or less 4

8,001 to 10,000 

5

10,001 or greater 6

1 

The maximum number of ADUs and JADUs is inclusive of the total

number ofADUs and JADUs that are permitted in accordance with

Section 141.0302.

(5) Fire Sprinklers. All affordable ADUs and bonus ADUs in the

development shall include an automatic fire sprinkler system in

accordance with the California Building Standards Code.

-PAGE 24 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(6) Minimum Required -Street Parking Spaces. One street

parking space shall be required for each affordable ADU and

bonus ADU located outside of

 a transit pr

iori area.

(7) Landscape Requirements. Two trees shall be provide

d on the

premises for every 5,000 squar

e feet of lot area, with a minimum

of one tree 

per premises.

 

If planting of a new tree is required to

comply with this Section, the tree shall be selected in accordance

with the Landscape Standards of the Land Development Manual

and the City's Street Tree Selection Guide. If thepremises is

located in the OR Zone, the lot area used to determine the tree

requirement shall be based on the allowable development area as

described in Section 131.0250. Ifthepremises contains

environmentally sensitive lands, the lot aea

 used to determine the

tree requirement shall be based on the allowable development area

as described in Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 1.

(8) ADUHome Density Bonus Agreement. The affordable ADUs shall

be guaranteed through a written agreement and a deed of trust

securing the agreement, entered in

to by the appücan

t and President

and Chief Executive Officer of the San Diego Housing

Commission, or their designee, pr

ior to the issuance

 of a Building

Permit for the first affordable ADU or bonus ADU, whichever

occurs first, that meets the following requirements:

(A) A rental affordable ADUhome density bonus

agreement shall uti

lize the foll

owing qualifyi

ng criteria:

-PAGE 25 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(i) ey Low Income ADUHome Density Bonus. One

additional bonus ADU shall be permitted for every

affordable ADU on thepremises that is set aside as

affordable to very low income households for a

period of not less than 10 years at a rent that does

not exceed 30 percent of 50 percent ofthe area

median income as adjusted for household size;

 

Low Income ADU Home Density

 

Bonus. One

additional bonus ADU shall be permitted for every

affordable

 

ADU on he premises

 that is set aside as

affordable to low income households for a period of

not less than 10 years at a rent that does not exceed

30 percent of 60 percent of the area median income

as adjusted for household size;

(iii)

 

Moderate Income ADU Home Density

 

Bonus. One

additional bonus ADU shall be permitted for every

affordable ADU on the premises

 

that is set aside as

affordable to moderate income households for a

period of not less than 15 years at a rent that does

not exceed 30 percent of 110 percent ofthe area

median income as

 

adjusted for household size; and

(iv)

 

The very low income, low income, and moderate

income affordable ADUs shall be comparable in

-PAGE 26 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

bedroom mix and amenities to the bonus ADUs in

the development.

(B) Violations. If the terms of the rental affordable

 ADUhome

density bonus agreement are violated by the appicant, the

applicant

 

shall be liable fo

r a minimum penalty of $10,000

per ADUper month, in addition to any fines outlin

ed in the

rental afforda

ble ADU home density bonus agreement with

the San Diego Housing Commission.

(9) ADUHome Density Bonus Program Community Enhancement

Fee. The applicant shall pay an ADU Home Density Bonus

Program Community Enhancement Fee as established by San

Diego Resolution, calculated based on the gross#oor area of the

affordable ADUs and bonus ADUs, except that the grossßoor area

of any affordable ADUs that meet all the follow

ing shall not be

included in the calculation:

(A) The affo

rdable ADU is deed

 restricted 

to very

 low income

or low income

 

households in ac

cordance

 with Section

141.0302(d)(8)(A)(i) or 1

41.0302(d)(8)(A)(ii); and

(B) The premises is located in an area identified as a High or

Very High Resource California Tax Credit Allocation

Committee (CTCAC) Opportunity Area when the

development application is deemed complete.

(e) ADUBonus for Accessible ADUs. For development utilizing the ADU

Home Density Bonus Program

 in accordan

ce with Section

 141.0302(d), a

-PAGE 27 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

maximum of one additional accessible ADUshall be permitted i f the

development includes:

(1) 

At least two ADUs that are affordable to very

 

low income, low

income, or moderate income

 

households; and

(2) 

The accessible ADU

 meets the following:

(A) 

Accessibility requirements in Chapter 11A of the California

Building Code, including at least one accessible bathroom,

one accessible kitchen, and one accessible

 

bedroom;

(B) 

The accessible ADU shall be located on an accessible route,

as defined by the California Building Code; and

(C) 

The accessible ADU shall be comparable in bedroom mix

and amenities to the bonus ADUs in the development.

(f) 

Sale or Conveyance ofADUs. New or existing ADUs may be converted

into condominiums and shall be sold or otherwise conveyed separately

from the primary residence in accordance with this Section or pursuant to

Section 141.0302(g) and subject to all the following:

(1) 

All structures and buildings included as part of a condominium

development shall conform to the requirements applicable to the

base zone or planned district in which the development is located.

Designation of individual condominium units shall not be deemed

to reduce or eliminate any of the base zone or planned district

requirements applicable to the buildings or structures. Unless

otherwise allowed for ADUs pursuant to Section 141.0302(b);

-PAGE 28 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(C

OR. COPY)

(A) The condominium subdivisio

n shall be c

reated pursuant to

the Davis-Stirling

 Common Interest 

Development Act

(Part 5 (commencing with section 4000) of Division 4 of

the California Civil Code);

(B) The condominium subdivision sha

ll be created in

conformance with the 

Subd

ivision M

ap Act

 

(Division 2

(commencing with California Government Code section

66410));

(C) Neither a subdivision m

ap nor a condominium plan shall be

recorded without each lienholder's written consent. The

following shall app

ly to the conse

nt of a li

enholde

r:

(i) A lienholder may refuse to give written consent; or

(ii) A lienholder may consent provided that any terms

and conditions required by the lienholder ar

e

satisfied;

(D) Prior to recordation of the initial or any

 subsequent

modifications to the con

dominium plan, written evidence of

the lienholder's cons

ent shall be provide

d to the Office of

the County Recorder of San Diego County along with a

signed statement from each lienhol

der that sta

tes the

(Name of lienholde

r) hereby co

nsents to

 the

following.

recording of this con

dominium plan in their 

sole and

absolute discre

tion and the borrower has or

 will satisfy

 any

addition

al term

s and con

dition

s the lienh

older may have."

;

-PAGE 29 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(E) The lienholder's written consent shall be included on the

condominium plan, or attached to the condominium plan

that includes the following information:

(i) The lienholder's signature;

ii) The name of the record owner or ground lessee;

(iii)

 

The legal description of the real property;

(iv) The identities of all parties with an interest in the

real property as reflected in the real property

records; and

(v) The lienholder's written consent shall be recorded

in the Office o f the County Recorder o 

f San Diego

County.

(2) The condominium development shall be subject to the Subdivision

requirements in Chapter 12, Article 5.

(3) The condominium development shall be subject to the

Condominium Conversion Regulations in Chapter 14, Article 4,

Division 5 i f any of the

 

ADUs in the development

 

were occupied.

(4) If an Al)U is established as a condominium, the applicant shall

notify providers of utilities, including water, sewer, gas, and

electricity, of the condominium creation and separate conveyance.

(5) The condominium development shall be located on a single parcel

or lot that was previously mapped and monumented in a manner

satisfactory to the City Engineer in accordance with Subdivision

Map Act Section 66428(b).

-PAGE 30 OF 38-



(O-2025-1

36 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(6) For a minimum period of 30 day

s from the date a

n ADU that 

is

established às a cond

ominium is first listed for 

sale, the

 record

owner shall offer the

 ADU through at least two publicly acces

sible

real estate websites or databases with a disclosure stating that the

ADU is being offered for at least 30 days to buyers intending to use

the ADU as their primary residence.

(7) ADUs that have received financing or other forms of assistance

from the San Diego Housing Commission shall not be converted

into condominiums and shall not be sold or otherwise conveyed

separately from the primary residence during the term specified in

the deed restriction agreement.

(8) Rental ADUs that are rent restricted by law or covenant to

persons and families of very low income, low income, or

moderate income

 shall not be converted into condominiums and

shall not be sold or otherwise conveyed separatel

y from the

primary residence for the dur

ation of the deed restriction or

afforda

bility

 coven

ant te

rm.

(g) Sale or Conveyance of an ADUby a nonprofit corporation.

(1) An ADUmay be sold or conveyed sep

arately from the primary

dwelling unit by a qualified nonprofit corporation.

(2) For the purpose of Section 141.0302(g), a qualified nonprofit

corporation means a nonprofit corporat

ion organ

ized pursuant to

Section 501(c)(3) of the Internal Revenue Code that has receive

d a

welfare exemption under the

 California

 Revenue and

 Taxation

-PAGE 31 OF 38-



(O-2025-

136 REV.)

(C

OR. COPY)

Code se

ction 214.15 for 

proper

ties in

tended to be s

old to

low-income

 

families w

ho part

icipate 

in a spe

cial no

-inter

est loan

program.

(3) Foran ADU tobesoldor conv

eyed separa

tely from

 the prim

ary

dwelling unit by a

 

qualifie

d nonp

rofit co

rporat

ion, th

e follow

ing

shall apply:

(A) There is

 an enforce

able re

stricti

on on the use of the

premises on which the ADU is loca

ted pursua

nt to a

recorde

d agreement bet

ween the quali

fied buyer an

d the

qualified no

nprofit corporati

on. For the 

purposes of Section

141.0302(g

)(3)(A), a qua

lified buyer 

means ve

 low

income, low income, median inc

ome, or m

oderate 

income

househ

olds, as

 spec

ified belo

w:

(i) ery low income ADUs shall be 

affordable

 to very

low income

 

households at an affordable hous

ing

cost t

hat do

es not

 exce

ed 30 perc

ent o

f 50 per

cent

of the area

 median income, as adjusted for

house

hold 

size, app

ropria

te for 

the AD

;

(ii) Low income ADUs shall be 

affordabl

e

 to low

income hous

eholds at an

 afford

able h

ousing cost

that doe

s not exce

ed 30 per

cent o

f 70

 percent

 ofthe

area median incom

e, as adju

sted fo

r househol

d size,

appropriate for the ADU

-PAGE 32 OF 38-



(O-2025-1

36 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(iii)

 Moderate inc

ome ADUs shall be affordable to

moderate income

 

households at a housing cost that

does not

 exceed

 35 of 110 percen

t ofthe

 area

median income, as adj

usted for

 household size,

approp

riate f

or the 

DU.

(B) The lot where the ADUis located

 is held pursuant t

o a

recorded tenancy in common agreement that in

cludes:

(i) An allocation

 to each

 qualified

 buyer of

 an

undivided,

 unequa

l interest in the lot 

based on the

sizeoftheADU each qual

ified buyer 

occupi

es;

(ii) A repurchase option that requires t

he qualified

buyer to fi

rst offe

r the qua

lified nonp

rofit

corporatio

n to buy the prope

rty if the buyer d

esires

to sell or c

onvey the property

;

(iii)

 

A requirem

ent that th

e qualif

ied buyer occup

y the

property as the 

qualifie

d buyer's 

principal

residence; and

(iv)

 

Affordability restrictions on the sale and

conveyan

ce of the prope

rty that en

sure the p

roperty

will be preser

ved for very low income, low incom

e,

median income, or modera

te incom

e

 households for

45 year

s for own

er-occu

pied housi

ng an

d will be

sold or resold to a qualified

 buyer.

-PAGE 33 OF 38-



(O-2025-1

36 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(C) A grant deed naming the granto

r, grantee, 

and describi

ng

the property interests be

ing transfer

red shall be r

ecorded

 in

the Office of the Recorder in S

an Diego County.

(D) A Preliminary Change of Ownership Report shal

l be filed

concurrent

ly with the grant dee

d pursu

ant to the California

Revenue and Taxation Code section 480.3.

(E) If requested by a utility providing service t

o the primary

residence

, the ADUhas a separ

ate water, sewer, or

electrical connection to that utility.

Section 5. 

Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 8 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 143.0815, to read as follows:

§143.0815

 

When Coastal Overlay Zone Affordable Housing Replacement Regulations

Apply

(a) [No change in text..1

(b) The following development types shall b

e reviewed for compliance with

the regulations in this Division:

(1) Conversion from rental unit

s or Accessory Dweling Units to

condominium units (co

operative or

 similar form of ownership);

(2) through (3) [No change in text.]

(c) [No change in text.]

Section 6. 

Chapter 1

4, Article 4,

 Division 5 0

 f the Sa

n Diego Municipal

 Code is

amended by amending section 144.0501, to read as follows:

§144.0501

 

Purpose of Condominium Conversion Regulation

s

-PAGE 34 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

The purpose 

of the Condominium Conversion Regulations is to 

allow the

conversion of apartments and Accesso

 Dwelling Units to con

dominiums while

protecting the interests 

of tenants b

y requiring that tenants

 receive ade

quate notic

e

ofproposed condominium conversions, are 

advised oftheir rights

 with respect to

the conversion of their apartment or Accesso Dweling Unit to a con

dominium,

and are afforde

d reasonable reloc

ation assistance. It is also the

 intent of these

regulations to protect the in

terests of the community and prospective purcha

sers

by requiring the applicant to provide certai

n information regarding the condition

of the structure and to require rea

sonable improvements for the health, safety, 

and

general welfare of the public.

Section 7. 

The Council dispenses with a full reading of this Ordinance before its

passage because a written copy of this Ordinance was made available

 to the Council and

 the

public before the date of its passage.

Section 8. 

Ordinances O-21758 (Jan. 16,2024) and O-21836 (July

 22,2024)

were considered by the Council and may amend San Diego Municipal Code sections also

amended by this Ordinance. Ordinances O-21758 and 0-21836 also require Ca

lifornia Coastal

Commission certification prior to becoming effective in the Coastal Overlay Zone. The

California Coastal Commission may propose modifications to San Diego Municipal Code

sections also amended by this Ordinance. The City Clerk, with the written approval and

concurrence of the City Attorney, is author

ized to reconcile the nu

mbering of sections and

placement o f text upon the final passa

ge of the Ordinances, without further

 action by the

Council, pursuant to San Diego Charter section 275.

Section 9. 

Before beco

ming effective, t

his Ordinance

 will be sub

mitted to the San

Diego County Regional Airport Authority (SDCRAA) acting as the

 Airport L

and Use

-PAGE 35 OF 38-



(O-2025-13

6 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

Commission (ALUC) for a consistency finding with the Airport Land Use Compatibility Plan

(ALUCP) for the San International Airport, Marine Corps Air Station Miramar, Gillespie Field,

Montgomery Field, and Brown Field Airports (èollectively, Airports). If the ALUC determines

this Ordinance is consist

ent with the ALUCP for the Airports, this Ordinance shall t

ake effect

and be in force on the date of the finding of consistency, provided that at least 30 days have

passed from the date of final passage, except that provisions of this Ordinance inside the Coastal

Overlay Zone, which are subject to Cali fornia Coastal Commission jurisdiction as a City of San

Diego Local Coastal Program amendment, will not take effect until the date the California

Coastal Commission uncondition

ally certifies th

ose provisions as a local coas

tal program

amendment.

If the ALUC determines this Ordinance is inconsistent or conditionally consistent, subject

to proposed modifications, with the ALUCP, this Ordinance will be submitted to the Council for

reconsideration. If the ALUC determines this Ordinance is conditionally consistent with the

ALUCP for the Airports, but consistency is subject to the proposed modifications, the Council

may amend this Ordinance to accept the proposed modifications, and this Ordinance as amended

will take effect and be in force on the thirtieth day from and after its final passage, except that

provisions of this Ordinance inside the Coastal Overlay Zone, which are subject to California

Coastal Commission jurisdiction as a City of San Diego Local Coastal Program amendment, will

not take effect until the date the California Coastal Commission unconditionally certifie

s those

provisions as a local coastal program amendment. A proposed decision by the Council to

overrule a determination or inconsistency, or to reject the prop

osed modifications for a finding of

conditional consistency, will include the findings required pursuant to California Public Utilities

Code section 21670 and require a two-thirds vote. The proposed decision and findings will be

forwarded to the ALUC, the California Department ofTransportation, Division of Aeronautics,

-PAGE 36 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

and the airport operators for the applicable airports; and the Council will hold a second hearing

not less than forty-five days from the date the proposed decision and findings weré provided. At

the hearing, any comments submitted by the public agencies will be considered and a final

decision to overrule a determination of inconsistency will require a two-thirds vote.

I f the Council makes a final decision to overrule a determination o f inconsistency, this

Ordinance will take effect on the thirtieth day after that final decision, except that provisions of

this Ordinance inside the Coastal Overlay Zone, subject to California Coastal Commission

jurisdiction as a City of San Diego Local Coastal Program amendment, will not take effect until

the date the California Coastal Commission unconditionally certifies those provisions as a local

coastal program amendment.

Section 10. That no permits shall be issued for development that is inconsistent with the

provisions of this Ordinance unless deemed complete applications for such permits are submitted

to the City prior to the date on which the applicable provisions of this Ordinance become

effective.

APPROVED: HEATHER FERBERT, City Attorney

By

'

r

r

 

 

Ý

I

-

Corrine L. Neuffer

Senior Chief Deputy City Attorney

CLN:cm:jn2:amt:cm:jn2

April 24,2025

June 13, 2025 COR. COPY

June 17, 2025 REV.

Or.Dept: City Planning

Doc. No. 4082424 3

-PAGE 37 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

I certify that the Council of the City of San Diego adopted this Ordinance at a meeting held on

JU

L 

2 

2

 2

0

25

DIANA J.S. FUENTES

City Clerk

By -d®2/> 2 .

Deputy City derk

-

TODD G]

[ayor

TODD GLORIA, Mayor

(NOTE: The date of final passage is July 23, 2025, which represents the day

this ordinance was returned to the Office of the City Clerk with the Mayor's

signature of approval.)

-PAGE 38 OF 38-

Approved:

(date)

Vetoed:

(date)



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE

OLD LANGUAGE: S ekOut

NEW LANGUAGE: Double Underline

ORDINANCE NUMBER 0-

 

(NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 11, ARTICLE 3,

DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY

AMENDING SECTION 113.0103; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,

ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 125.0431;

AMENDING CHAPTER 13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY

AMENDING SECTION 131.0322; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY RETITLING AND AMENDING

SECTION 141.0302; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 3,

DIVISION 8 BY AMENDING SECTION 143.0815; AND

AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 4, DIVISION 5 BY

AMENDING SECTION 144.0501, RELATING TO THE

AMENDMENT TO THE ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT AND

JUNIOR ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT REGULATIONS.

§113.0103

 Definitions

Abutting property through Accessory building No change in text.1

Accessoy Dwelling Unit (ADU) means an attached or detached residential

dwelling unit

 

that is 1,200 square feet in size or less, provides complete

independent living facilities for one or more persons including permanent

provisions for living, sleeping, eating, cooking, and sanitation, and is located on a

e#wih*the same premises as the proposed or existing single dwelling unit or

multiple dwelling unit.

Accesso structure through Suce Mining [No change in text.]

Sustainable Development Area means the area within a defined walking distance

along a pedestrian path of travel using sidewalks from a

 

major transit stop

 that is

-PAGE 1 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

existing or planned, if the planned

 

major transit stop is

 

included in a

transportation improvement program or applicable regional transportation plan, as

follows:

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Within Mobility Zone 4, as defined in Section 143.1103, the defined

walking distance is Q.75 mile.

(c) [No change in text.]

In addition, an adopted specific plan prepared in accordance with seeiøn-Section

122.0107(a), shall be within

 

the Sustainable Development Area if the Sustainable

Development

 

Area is within a portion of the adopted specific plan.

Target population throuh Yard [No change in text.1

§125.0431

 

Additional Notice for a Condominium Conversion Map

(a) For a tentative map for a condominium conversion project, the subdivider

shall provide the following notices in addition to the notice provided for in

Chapter 11, Article 2, Division 3 (Notice):

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Notice to each person applying for the rental of a uiklwellin unit

or Accessory Dwelling Unit in the proposed project required in

Chapter 11, Article 2, Division 3 (Notice) and

 Subdivision 

Map Act

section 66452.17;

(3) through (5) [No change in text.]

(b) through (c) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 2 OF 46-



(O-2025-

136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

§131.0322

 

Use Regulations Table for Agricultural Zones

The uses allowed in the agricultural zones are shown in Table 131.03B.

Legend for Table 131-03B

[No change in text.]

Table 131-03B

Use Regulations Table for Agricultural Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

[See Section 131.0112 for an explanation and

descriptions of the Use Categories,

Subcategories, and Separately Regulated

Uses]

Zone

 

Zones

Designator

1 st & 2nd

 

A

G AR

>>

3rd >> 1- 1-

4th » 1 2 1 2

Open Space through Residential, Separately Regulated

Residential Uses, Interim Ground

 

Floor

 

Residential 84

change in text.]

Junior Accessory Dwelling Units

[No change in text.]

-

_ [No change

in text.]

Residential, Separately Regulated Residential Uses,

Live/Work Quarters through Signs, Separately Regulated

Signs Use, Theater Marquees [No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Footnotes for Table 131-03B

 through  [No change in text.]

§141.0302

 

Accessory Dwelling Units ADUs) and Junior Accessory Dwelling Units

(JADUs)

Section 111.0302 provides for the constction of Accesso Dweing Units

ÇADUs) nd Junior Accessory Dwelling Units JADUsi-eeewñ·ñe

rcquirenents-øf-state a¥rand is-intended to encourage the costuctio of,DUs

and 1.DUs through several local regulatory provisions, including eliminating

parking reuirments for l)Us and.LDUs, and providing an affordable housing

bonus of one additional 

D for every deed

 restricted affor

dable DU

-PAGE 3 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

constructed on theprmiscs, as s

pecified in

 the regulation

s below. DUs are

permitted in all zones allowing residential uses, and JADUs are permitted i-all

Single Dwelling Unit Zøes-byright as a limited use decided 

in accordance

 with

Process One, indicated with an "L" in the Use Regulation

s Tables in Chapter 13,

Article 1 (Base Zones), subje

ct to the foll

owing regulations.

(a) The-felløwing defiitions apply to this section:Regulations for ADUs and

JADUs.

(1) Singe Dwelling Unit Zone means a zone

 that permits single

'cHing units but

 does not

 permit multiple d

ling unit:Guest

Quarters. Guest quarters a

nd non-habitabl

e

 

accessory structures

shall be permitted in addition to ADUs and JADUs, if permitted by

the base zone.

(2) Multiple Dwelling Unit Zone means a zone-that-permits-muple

dweiýui

 

Development Impact Fees. Development Impact

Fees for ADUs and JADUs shall be paid

 in accordan

ce with

Section 142.0640(b).

 Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban Lot Split Regulations.

 An ADU or

JADU shall not be perm

itted to be constructed on any premises

that has utilized the provisions of Chapter 14, Article 3, Division

13, Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban Lot Split Reulations for

Single Family Zones, except 

as provide

d in Section

143.1305(c)(1).

-PAGE 4 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

íì Previously Conforming. Construction

 

of an ADU or JADU

 shall

not require correction

 

of previously conforming

 conditions on the

premises.

í Conversion. An ADUorJADU that is converted from an existing

dwelling unit or accessory structure. or is

 

constructed in the same

location and within the same

 

building envelope as an

 

existing

dwelling unit or accessoy structure. may continue to observe the

same setbacks as the existing

 

dwelling unit or accessory structure

and they shall not be subiect to the setback requirements in Section

141.0302(b)(9).

ím Fire Sprinklers.

A) An ADUor JADU shall not be required to provide

automatic fire sprinklers if they are not required for the

primary

 

dwelling unit.

(B) An ADUor JADU shall be required to provide an automatic

fire sprinkler system when located on a premises where the

primary dwellin unit is protected with an automatic fire

sprinkler system in accordance with the California Building

Standards Code.

(C) The construction of a detached ADU shall not trigger a

requirement for automatic fire sprinklers to be installed in

the existing primary dwellin unit or multiple dwelling unit

-PAGE 5 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

unless required in accordance with the California Building

Standards Code.

El Within the Coastal Overlay Zone.

(A) An existing

 

structure may

 

only be converted or

reconstructed as an ADUor JADUifthe structure

conforms to all the following regulations:

í

i

)

 

T

h

e 

wetland

 

regulations in Section 143.0141(b);

íj

i

 

T

h

e s

e

ns

it

iv

e

 

coastal bluffs

 

regulations in Section

143.0143:

iii) The

 coastal beaches 

regulations in Section

143.0144; and

íix

 

The Supplemental Regulations of the Coastal

Overlay Zone in Section 132.0403.

(B) ADUs or

 JADUs 

constructed within areas of future sea

level rise shall comply with the regulations in Section

132.0404.

(C) AD Us or JADUs shall comply with all the following

regulations:

íi The

 

wetland 

regulations in Section 143.0141(b):

i The sensitive

 

coastal bluffs

 

regulations in Section

143.0143:

í

ü

ü

 The coastal beaches

 

regulations in Section

143.0144; and

-PAGE 6 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

íix

 

The Supplemental Regulations of the Coastal

Overlay Zone in Section 132.0403.

íâl An ADU shall not be used for a rental term of less than 31

consecutive days. JADUs are not subject to rental term limitations.

(b) The following regulations are applicable to both ADUs and JDUs: dQU

Development Regulations.

(1) WRegaiesOn a premises with an existing or proposed single

dwelling unit, the

 

following is permitted:

(A) One DUand one JDU arc permitted on apremiscs

located within a Single Dwelling Unit Zone with an

existing or proposed single d'lling unit.One ADU that is

within an existing or proposed single dwelling unit or

within an existing accessory structure, subject to the

following:

íi Construction of the

 

ADU may

 

expand the

 

gross

.floor area of an existin accessory structure up to

150 square feet to only allow for ingress and egress

and

íii The AD U shall have a separate exterior entry from

the single dwelling unit.

(B) An ADUor JADU shall not be used for a rental term of less

than 31 consecutive daysOne attached or detached ADU

-PAGE 7 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

 Guest quarters and non habitable accessoy structures

shall be permitted in addition to DUs and JADUs.

3 A AeceseryDwelling Unit or Jnior Accessory

Dwelling Unit shall not be permittedto-be-ønstueted-øn

any premises

 

that has utilized the provisions of Chapter

11, Article 3, Division 13, Mlti Dwelling Unit and Urban

Lot Split Regulatios for Single Family Zones, except as

provided in Section 113.1305(c)(1).

(2) Development RegulationsThe maximum number ofADUs on a

premises

 

with a proposed

 

multiple dwelling unit structure

 shall not

exceed two detached ADUs.

A A minimum ot size is not required for the construction of

an ADU or JADU.

 ADUs and JADUs are not subject to the density limitations

for the premises.

 The grossfloer area of an ADU and JADU shall e

included in the oor area ratie for the premises.

(D) An ADUor JADU that is converted from an existing

dvlling unit or accessory structur or is constructed in the

   

  

- 1.  ad within the i  

building envelope as an

existing-dweg-unitørceesseo structure may continue

to observe the same :ctback as the existing dvlling unit

or aecessey-tuee. An existing structure may ot bo

-PAGE 8 OF 46-



(O-2025-136REV.)

(COR. COPY)

coñvérted or reconstructed as à DUor.JADU.the

stcturc does not conformto the wetlands regulatioís in

Section 1/13.0141(b),the sensitive.coaštal.blíffs regulations

in Section,143.01/13, the coastal.beches

 

regulations in

Setion 113.0111, orthe Supplëmentàl Regultions of tlie

Coastal Overlay Zone in S

eêtion 1320403.

l[1 fllov:ing landscape==regulation shall-appli-tohe

cstruction of an ADU or JDU:

(Ø Ifthe construction of an AbUor.JADUbrings the

numbr of ADUs ánd any liDUon:théprmiss to

 total of two or more, tii'o treés-shall be ròvidd

on the premises for everý 5,000 squaé fet òf lotž 

area, with a minimum of onétrcé per premises. If

planting of a new troo is re®ired totomplý with,

this Section; the tree shall bé eected in accordance

with the Landscape Stadrds f,thè Land

Development Manual and the.CitýŠ Street Tree

Selection Guide. Iftheprmiésislocated'in the

ORZone, thelotarea used to determinthe tre

requirement shall be based oñ théallowable

development area as described in Section 131.0250.

Ifthepremiscs contains chvironmentäly:nsiive

lnds, the lot area used-to determine thtrco

-PAGE 9 OF 46-

i

J

r

r



(O-2025-13

6 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

requiremnt shall be based on the allowable

development area as described in Chapter 11,

Article 3, Divsion 1.

0 ADUs constructed in accordac with Section

111.0302(c)(2)(C) shall comply with the street tree

requirements in Section 112.0109(a).

 DUs and JD Us shall not-be-roquird-to previd fire

sprinklers if they are not required for the primary dwclüng

unit. When located on aprcmiscs where the primary

dvelling unit is protected with an automatic fire sprinkler

system in accordance with Section R313 ofthe California

Residential Code, an DU or JDU shall be protected with

an automatic fire sprinkler system.

G Consruction ofan ADU or JADU shall ot reqire tho

correction 

of previousy conforming

 

conditions on the

pemise

( D  and JDUs constructed within Areas of Future Sea·

Lvcl Ris must eemply witeeglaiøsi

Sectiøn 132.0401.

 Within the Coastal Overlay Zone, DUs and liDUs shall

comply with the wetlands regulations in Section

443.-4-. sensitive-eøastal blffs-regulatiens-in

Section 113.0113, the coastal

 beaches regulations in

-PAGE 10 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

Section 113.0141, and the Supplemental Roguations of the

Coastal Oveplay Zone in Section 132.0403.

(3) Pig-Reglatiøs On a premises with an existing multiple

dwelling unit structure. the

 

following applies:

(A) No on street parking spaces or ýstecp*ing- 

S CC 

reuired for ADUs and JDUs except as specified-in-Sectin

141.0302(b)3)(B).The maximum number

 of ADUs 

that may

be permitted within the existing non-livable space of an

existing multiple dwellin unit structure shall not exceed

25 percent o f the total number of multiple dwelling units in

the structure. The minimum number ofADUs that may be

permitted within the non-livable space ofthe existing

structure is one. For example, non-livable space includes, but

is not limited to, storage rooms, boiler rooms, passageways.

attics, basements, or garages; and

(B) When an ADUor JDUis proposed on apremiscs located

both ::ithin-the Beah-Ipac-rea-of

-

the-Pakig-paet

Overlay Zone and outside of a

 

transit priority

 

area, one

oýtrctparking space located consistent with Section

11 1.0302(b)(3)(D) shall berequied-per.DU-r

-

1D,

f th folowing--appb+A maximum of eight

detached ADUs may be permitted on the premises, provided

that the number of detached ADUs shall not exceed the

-PAGE 11 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

number of existing multiple dwelling units in the multiple

dwelling_unit structure.

Ø The ADUor JADUis 500 square feet or less;

0 Theppemiscs is located within a historical distric

hal is a designated historical resourc,

 The -AUør Ui-attached--tethe-pepøsed or

v +n 4*nn  A.„11   a -. -,

1111 11111141,7 .. 5  vi

 

.J 

SFU F

 The premises is located with a residential permit

parking district;

 There is a car share vehicle located within one block

of the premises.

((B When a garage, carport, or covered parking structure is

demolished in conjunction with the construction

 

of an ADU

or JDU, or converted to an ADUor JADU, replacement of

those o strectparking spaces is not required unless the

premises is located both within the Beach Impact Area of

the Parking Impact Overlay Zone and outside of a transit

priorio area, in which case the parking shall be replaced in

a location consistent with Sectio 1/11.0302(b)(3)(D).

 If e street parking spaces are

 

required in accordance with

Section 111.0302(b)(3)(B) or 111.0302(b)(3)(C),or if the

applicant choses to provide

 

of street paring spaces for

-PAGE 12 OF 46-



(O-2025-1

36 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

DUs and/or JADUs located on thepremiscs, those spaces

shall comply with the following:

(0 strectparking spaces may bc located in ay

configuratio, may be within th

 

setback 

areas, and

may include tandem spaces or mechanical lifts.

0 Qstrctparking spacs shall be located within

hardscape areas and shall comply with the minimum

standards and guidelines to provide safe and

efficient means ofvehicular access to the lot.

 Notwithstanding 111.0302(b)(2)(H), if the construction of

an DUorJADU causes an existing driveway curb cut to

11 lll  V ll V 1  Illl1ll -11  111 1 

1/12 -05K of Section 112.0560 for an ýstrectparking

nc,-the drieway shall be closed to the satisfaction of tho

City Engineer.

(4) Development Impact Fees for DU: and liD  shall comply with

Section 112.0610(b). In accordance with Government Code section

66321(b)(3), one attached or detached ADU with a ross #oor area

of 800 square feet or less may be permitted in accordance with

Sections 141.0302(a)(1)-(a)(31 provided that the development

results in no more than one attached or detached ADU on the

premises. The ADU shall not be subject to maximum lot coverae,

-PAGE 13 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

maximum #oor area ratio, a front yard setback, and minimum

open space requirements of the underlying base zone.

íãl Lot Size. A minimum lot size is not required for the construction

of an ADU

íl Density. ADUs are not subject to the

 

density

 

limitations of the base

zone for the premises.

l 

Gros

s F

loo

r A

rea

.

A) The ross loor area of an AD U shall not be less than 150

square feet.

(B) The gross #oor area ofan attached or detached ADU shall

not exceed 1,200 square feet.

(C) An ADU constructed within an existing or proposed

 

single

dwelling unit structure shall not have a maximum ross

oor area requirement.

(D) An ADU constructed within an existing accssoy structure

on a single dwelling unit lot shall not have a maximum

gross loor area requirement and may construct an

additional 150 square feet to only allow for ingress and

egress.

(E) ADUs constructed within an existing multple dwelling unit

structure shall not have a maximum gross /oor area

requirement.

-PAGE 14 OF 46-

1
.



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(Fì The

 

gross floor area

 of an ADU

 shall be included in the

oor area ratio for the premises.

£ Height.

(A) On lots that permit sinle dwellin unit development but

not multiple dwelling unit development, detahed ADU

structures shall not exceed two stories.

Bì On lots 

that permit

 

single dwelling unit development but

not multiple dwelling unit development, ADUs attahed to

an existing accessoy structure shall not exceed two stories.

C ADUs shall comply with the overall maximum structure

height of the underlying base zone and overlay zone.

21 Setbacks.

(A) The front yard setback of an ADU shall be consistent with

the base zone.

(B) 

The minimum

 

street side yard setback

 of an ADU shall be

4 feet or the minimum

 

street side yard setback

 of the base

zone, whichever is less.

(Cì Interior

 

side yard and rear yard setbacks for ADU

structures with a structure heiht of 16 feet or less shall be

provided as follows:

í

i

 

F

o

r

 

ADU structures

 

located on a

 

premises

 outside

of a High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone,

there is no minimum interior sideyard and rear

-PAGE 15 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

yard setback, except that t

he Fire Code Official

may require a greater s

etback to ensure compliance

with the California Fire Code, California Code of

Regulations (CCR), Title 14, Section 1276.01, and

the International Fire Code (IFC), including section

504.1.

(i For ADU structures

 

located on a premises within a

High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, the

minimum interior side yard and rear yard setbacks

shall be 4 feet to provide de

fensible space

 between

all structures on the

 

premises and

 

contiguous areas

of native

 or natural

ized vege

tation, exc

ept that the

Fire Code Official may require a greater se

tback to

ensure com

pliance with the California Fi

re Code.

California 

Code of Regulatio

ns (CCR), Title 14.

Section 1276.01, and the Internati

onal Fire Code

(IFC), including section 504.1.

(D) Interior side yard and rear yardsetback for ADU

structures with a structu

re heiht that ex

ceeds 16 feet s

hall

be provid

ed as follo

ws:

í

i

ì

 

F

o

r

 ADU structures

 

located on a

 

premises

 outside

of a High or Very High Fire Hazard 

Severi

ty Zone

there is no

 minimum interior si

de yard and rear

-PA

GE 16 O

F 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

yard setbacks, except that the Fire Code Official

may require a greater setback to ensure compliance

with the California Fire Code. However, if the side

or rear proper hne abuts another premises that is

residentially zoned or developed with exclusively

residential uses, the minimum interior side

 

yard and

rear yard setbacks shall be 4 feet or the minimum

setback 

of the applicable base zone, whichever is

less, except that the Fire Code Official may require

a greater setback to ensure compliance with the

California Fire Code, California Code of

Regulations (CCR), Title 14, Section 1276.01, and

the International Fire Code (IFC), including section

504.1.

(àl For ADU structures

 located on

 

a premises

 

within a

High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, the

minimum interior side

 

yard and ear yard setbacks

shall be 4 feet to provide defensible space between

all structures on the premises and any contiguous

areas o f native or naturalized vegetation or as

otherwise required, except that the Fire Code

Official may require a greater setback to ensure

compliance with the California Fire Code,

-PAGE 17 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

California Code ofRegulations (CCR), Title 14,

Section 1276.01, and the International Fire Code

(IFC), including section 504.1.

£1

 

Parking.

(A) No on-street parking spaces or -street parking spaces are

required for ADUs, except as specified in Section

141.0302(b)(10)(B).

(Bì When an ADU is proposed on a premises located both

within the Beach Impact Area of the Parking Impact

Overlay Zone and outside of a transit priority area, one

off-street parking space

 

located consistent with Section

141.0302(b)(10)(D) shall be required per ADU unless any

of the following apply:

íi The ADUis 500 square f

eet or less

:

íil The premises is located within a historical district

tha is a designated historical resourc,

(iii)

 

The ADU is attached to the proposed or existing

rmary dwelling unit or accessory structure

íix

 

The premises is located within a residential permit

parking district; or

íx There is a car share vehicle located within one

block of the premises.

-PAGE 18 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(C When a garage, carport, or covered parking structure is

demolished in conjunction with the construction of an

ADU, or converted to an ADU, replacement of those oT-

street parking spaces is not required unless the premises is

located within the Beach Impact Area of the Parking

Impact Overlay Zone and outside of the

 

transit priority

area, in which case parking shall be replaced in a location

consistent with Section 141.0302(b)(10)(D).

D) When an uncovered parking space is demolished in

conjunction with the construction of an ADU, or converted

to an ADU, replacement ofthose o-street parking

spaces is not required.

E) If -street parkin spaces are required in accordance with

Section 141.0302(b)(10)(B) or 141.0302(b)(10)(C), or if

the applicant chooses to provide off-street parking spaces

for ADUs located on the

 

premises, the

 

following applies:

ñ Off-street parking spaces may be

 located within the

setback areas, and may include tandem saces or

mechanical lifts; and

íii 0/street parking spaces shall be located within

hardscape areas and shall comply with the

minimum standards and guidelines to provide safe

and efficient means of vehicular access to the lot.

-PAGE 19 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

Of-street parking spaces may not encroach into the

public right-of-way.

(Fì Notwithstanding Section 141.0302(a)(4), ifthe construction

of an ADU causes an existing driveway curb cut to no

longer comply with the minimum of-street parking spaces

dimensions required in Table 142-05K of Section

142.0560, the driveway shall be closed to the satisfaction of

the City Engineer.

(11) The record owner is not required to live on the same premises of

an ADU.

(c) In addition to the requirements in Section 111.0302(a), the following

additional regulations are applicable to ADUs:

 Development Regulations

for JADUs.

(1) WReglatiesOn a premises with an existing or proposed sinle

dwelling unit, one JADU is permitted, subject to the following:

(A) The record oner is not required to live on the same

premises as the AD U.The JADUshall be within an existing

or prposed single dwelling unit or attached garage;

(B) The ADU may not be sold or conveyed separately from the

primary dlling unit unless all of the following

applyConstruction of the JADU may expand the floor area

of the existing single dwelling unit up to 150 square feet to

only allow for ingress and egress;

-PAGE 20 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

 The AD U was built or deveoped by a qualified

nonprofit corporation. For the purposes of

Section 141.0302(b)(1B)(i), a qualified nonprofit

i l.lll 11 ll. 4 11111-  il-n ll

organized pursuant to S

ection 501(c)(3) of the

Internal Revenue Code that has reèeived a welfare

exempti uder Section 211.15 of the California

Revenue and Taxation Code for properties intended

to be sold to low income families who participate in

a special no interest loan program.

00 There is an enforceable restriction on the use of the

premises on which the ADU is located pursant to a

recorded contract betwocn the qualified buyer and

the qualified nonprofit corporation. For the

purposes of Section 111.0302(b)(1)(B)(ii), a

qualified buyer m

eans vcy low incom

e, low

income, median income, or moderate income

useholds, as specified in Table 111 03.

Ø Th lot where the ADU is lecated is held pursuant to

a recorded tenancy in common agreement that

includes an allocation to each qualified buyer of an

size of th ADUeach qualified buyer o

ccpies; a

-PAGE 21 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

repurchase option that requires the qualified buyer

- to first offer the qualified nonprofit corporation to

: buy the property if the buyer desires to sell or

convey the property; a requirement that the

qualified buyer occupy the property as the qualified

buyer's principal residence; and affordability

restrictions on the sale and conveyance of the

property that ensure the property will be preserved

for vey low income, low income, median income or

moderate income

 

households for 15 years for

owner occupied housing and will be sold or resold

to a qualified buyer.

 A grant decd naming the grantor, grantee, and

urrun . F.v. .,y ni.-eing-tansferred

shall be-recorded-with the-County. A-Preiminary

Change of Ownershiþ Report shall be-filed

9-grant ded-pursuant to

Section 180.3 of the Revenue ad Taxation Code.

 If requested by a utility providing service to the

primary residence, the DU has a separate water,

sewer, or electrical connection to that utility.

(C The JADU shall have a separate exterior entry from the

existing or proposed single dwellin unit;

-PAGE 22 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(D) The JADUmay notbesoldor conveyed separately from

the primary

 

dwelling unit

E) The'record owner of the primary

 

dwelling unit

 shall reside

in the single dwelling unit or JADU ad

(Fì Before a Building Permit may be issued for a JAD U, the

record owner shall enter into an agreement with the City in

a form that is approved by the City Attorney that includes

the following provisions:

íi The 14DUmay not be sold or conveyed separately

from the primary

 

dwelling uni,

íii The agreement may be enforced against future

purchasers:

(

ii

i)

 

The record owner shall reside on the 

premises

{ix

 

The agreement shall be recorded in the Office of the

County Recorder of San Diego County; and

íx) The agreement shall run with the land for the life of

the JADU.

(G) Government agencies, land trusts, and qualified housing

organizations are exempt from Section 141.0302(c)(1)(E)

and Section 141.0302(c)(1)(F).

G) Develepment

 

Regulatios for ADUsLot Size. JAD Us are not

subject to a minimum lot size.

-PAGE 23 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

A) DU shall bo permitted in all zones allowing residential

uses, consistent with the Use Table of the applicable base

ž

(B One ADU shall be permitted in a Single Dwelling Unit

Zone on

 

ù premises

 

with an existing or proposed singl

veiným6

 On apremiscs located in a Single Dwelling Unit Zone with

an-eisting-ml* lling unit, or apremiscs located in

a Multiple Dwelling Unit Zone with-noasting o

proposed dcing unit, 1,DUs shall bc permitted as

felløws

 Two .iDUs that are attached to and/or detached

from an existing or proposed structur are

0 The number ofDUs permitted within the habitable

arca of an existing dweig-u:

it stuu

re is-limited

to 25 percet ofthe total number of exising

dvelling units in the tructure, but in no case shall it

be less than one DU; and

1 11i  l 11J

 

limit-ønh number ofDU: permitted

within the portions of existing dvlling unit

tructures and accssoy structurs that are not used

as livable space, including storage rooms, boiler

-PAGE 24 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR.· COPY) -

rooms, passageways, attics basements, or garagès,

if each DU complies with state building standards

- for dwelling units.

 A maximum of one DU,with a gros:floor area of 800

šquare fect or less shall be permitted on

 

Ù Ímiscs

 with a

. existing-er-pposed-dlling unit gardles c fiimun

lot coverage, maúmumfloorarea ratio, front yard 

setback, and minimum open space re4uirements. The

devélepmént shall comply with thefloorarea ratio of the 

underlying base zone unless thé devlopmet incorporates

an existing structure that exceeds the allowhblefloor ara

 ratio or is nder the allowableßoorarca ratio-by less than

800 square feet, in which case an DU that dócs not exceed

800 square feet shall be periitted.

 An4Umay-beattached to, located within, or detached

from an existinor proposed pimary dweing-nit,

including garages and habitablé or non habitableeessey

s.eh

es

 The minimum gross#oor arêa of

 an,4DU shall not

 be less

than 150 square feet. The maximum gross#oer area f an

ADU shall not exceed 1,200 square feet. An DU

cønstruèted-within-an-istig-dwelling unit or a

ccessory

. structure does not have a maximum

 

grossßoor area and

-PAGE 25 OF 46- ·

1



(O-202

5-1

36 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

may construct a additional 150 square feet for ingress and

eeel,

DUstrt shall comply with the front yard and street

side yard sctbacks

 

of the base zone. Interior side

 

yard n

rear yardctback for new DUstructure shall be

pid-afelleWS

Ø One story DUstructures with atructurc height

16 feet or less may observe a zero foot setback at

the interior side yard and rear yard.

0 One sory.4-with a structure height that

exceeds 16 feet and multi stoy DU structure

may observe zero foot interior side yard and rear

yard sctbacký, unless the side or :carreert

abuts another premises that is residentially zoned or

developed with exclusively residential uses, in

which case a 1 foot setback or the minimum setback

of the applicable base zone, whichever is less, shall

appl 

(H ADU Bous for Affordabl ADUs. One additienal ADU

shall bepermitted for every DU on theprmiscs that is set

aside as affordable to very low income and low incomo

households for a period of not less than 10 years, or as

affordable to

 moderate income

 

households for a period of

-PAGE 26 OF 46-

f



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

not less than 15 years, guaranteed through a written

ag. ccnent

 

and a ded of trust securing the agreement,

entered into by the applicant and the President and Chief

Executive Officer of the San Diego Housing Commission.

 There is no limit on the number of bonus ADU

Ú a Sustainabc Development Ac .

0 One bonus ADUis permitted outside a

 Sustainabe

 For ADUs to be counted as affodable and meet the

requirements of this Section, the qualifying criteria

in Table 111 03A shal bc met.

Table 141-03A

Qualifying Criteria for Affordable DU Bonus

Rental4¿

 - -74

shall be affordable at an

icuding-n-løwee ffedabehøuiøgs

fr-tilitiesrt-*en-*ht *he-dees-ø-e*eeed

dos not xd:

30 percent of 50 percent of 30 percent of 50 percent of

the area inedian income, as he area inui·anincenrs

adjusted for family size

 

djusted for family size

appropriate for the unit.

 

appropriate for the unit.

30 percent of60 percent of 30 percent of 70 percent of

the area median income, as the area median income, as

adjusted fo

r family size

 

adjusted for family size

 lu   1  11

 

appropriate for the unit.

30 percent of 110 percent

 

35 percent of 110 percent

of the area median income, of the area median income,

as adjusted for family size as adjusted for family size

appropriate for the unit.

 

appropriate for the unit.

-PAGE 27 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

Footnotes for Table 141-03A

€1 For salo DUs are subject to,the requiremnts of Section 111.0302(c)(1)(B).

 DUBonus for Accessible DUs. For development

utilizing the ADUBonus for Affordable ADUs in

accordance with Section 111.0302(c)(2)(H), a maximum of

one additional accessible DU shall be permitted ifthe

deelepmenedes

 Ateast-twe.4)9-shall-be-ffedabl-e-v'-lw

income, low income, or moderate income

heseheldsad

 The accessible ADU shall comply with the

felewig

(a Accessibility requirements in Chapter 1 lA of

the California Building Code, including at

least one accessible bathroom, one accessible

/dtchen, and one accessible bedroom; and

b) Th accessile ADU shall be located on an

accessible route, as defined by the California

Buiding-ede

£1 Density. JADUs are not subject to the densio limitations for the

premises.

( Gross Floor Area.

(A) The

 

gross floor area of a JADU

 shall not be included in the

floor area ratio for the premises.

-PAGE 28 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(B) A JADU shall not be less than 150 square feet and shall not

exceed 500 square feet within an existing or proposed

single dwelling unit.

£ Exterior Entry. A JADU shall have a separate exterior entry from

the primary

 

dwelling unit.

íl Kitchen. A

 JA

D

U 

shall include the following:

(A) A cooking facility with appliances:

I A food preparation counter of a reasonable size in relation

to the size ofthe JADU; and

(Cì Storage cabinets that are of a reašonable size in relation to

the size of the JADU.

l 

Parking.

(A} No ón-street parking spaces or of-street parking spaces are

required for a JADU.

(B When an attached garage is converted to a JAD U,

replacement of those

 

off-street parking spaces

 is not

required unless the premises is located within the Beach

Impact Area of the Parking Impact Overlay Zone and

outside of a 

transit priority area, in

 

which case parking

shall be replaced in a location consistent with Section

141.0302(c)(7)(C).

(C If of-street parking spaces are required in accordance with

Section 141.0302(c)(7)(B) or ifthe

 

applicant

 

chooses to

-PAGE 29 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

provide off-street parking spaces for JADUs located on the

premises, the

 

following applies:

íiì Of-street parking spaces mêy be located within the

setback areas, and may include tandem spaces or

mechanical lifts; and

(i Off-street parking spaces

 shall be located within

hardscape areas and shall comply with the

minimum standards and guidelines to provide safe

and efficient means of vehicular access to the lot.

O-street parking spaces may not encroach into the

public right-of-way.

(D) Notwithstanding Section 141.0302(a)(4),if the construction

of a JADU causes an existing driveway curb cut to no

longer comply with the minimum ostreet parking space

dimensions required in Table 142-05K of Section

142.0560, the

 driveway shall b

e closed to th

e satisfacti

on of

the City Engineer.

(d) In addition to the requirements in Section 111.0302(b),JDU: are subject

to the following additional regulations ADU Home Density Bonus. In

addition to the ADUs and JADUs permitted under Sections 141.0302(b)

and 141.0302(c), additional bonus ADUs and affordable

 AD

U

s

 shall be

ermitted subect to all of the following:

(1) Use-ReguiesLocation Requirements.

-PAGE 30 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(A) One JDU is permitted on aprmises located within a

Single Dwelling Unit Zone with an existing or proposed

primary single dvelling unitThe portion of the premises

roposed for development may not be within the following

base zones: RS-1-1, RS-1-2, RS-1-3, RS-1-4, RS-1-8, RS-

1-9, RS-1-10, or RS-1-11, unless the following apply:

íi The premises is in an area identified as a High or

Highest California Tax Credit Allocation Committee

(CTCAC) Opportunity Area when the development

application is

 

deemed complet, and

íi The premises is identified as Residential in

 a land

use plan.

(B) The JADUmay not be sold or conveyed separately from the

pi we#iýui#On a premises within the Sustainable

Development

 

Area, one additional bonus ADUshall be

ermitted for every additional affordable ADU.

(C) Before a Building Permit may bo issued for a JADU, the

record one shall enter into an agreement with the City in

a form that is approved by the City Attorney. The

agreement shall include the following provisions: the

1.DU may not be sold or conveyed separately from the

primary ding unit; the agreement may be enforced

against future purchasers; and the-oewpshal-eside

-PAGE 31 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

e-thormises. The City shall submit the agreement to the

County Recorder for recordation. The agreement shall run

with the land for the life of the 

JADUOn a premises

 outside

ofthe

 

Sustainable Development

 

Area, a maximum of one

bonus ADU and one affordable ADU shall be permitted.

(D When a premises is located in more than one base zone,

only the portion of the premises that meets the

requirements of Section 141.0302(d)(1)(A) shall be eligible

for bonus ADUs and affordable ADUs as specified in

Sections 141.0302(d)(1)(B) or 141.0302(d)(1)(C).

(2) eeepmet RgulationsLot Requirements.

(A) OnelDUis permitted on aprmiscs located within a

Single Dwelling Unit Zone with an existing or proposed

primary single dveing unit.Within High and Very High

Fire Hazard Severity Zones, the

 

applicant

 shall

demonstrate that the lot fronts an improved public street

with at least two evacuation routes to the satisfaction of the

Fire Code Official; and

(B) A JADUof notless than 150 square feet and not more tha

500 square feet is permitted within an existing or proposed

single dlling unit, or an attached garageWithin High and

Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones, the lot shall not

-PAGE 32 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

front a cul-de-sac or be located on a

 

premises

 

that only has

one point of ingress or egress.

 AlDU shall have-a separate exterior entry from the

primary dvlling unit.

D) The JADU shall include the followig:

(0 A cooking facility with appliances;

0 A food preparation counter of a reasonable size in

relation to the size of the JADU; and

0 ege-cabinets- that are of a reasonable siz i

relation to the size of the JADU.

(31 Floor Area Ratio.

(A) Within a base zone that permits single dwelling unit

developments,but not multiple dwelling unit developments.

the maximum floor area ratio shall be determine as

follows:

íiì Where the lot contains environmentally sensitive

lands, the maximum permitted #oor area ratio shall

be determined using only the area of the lot that

does not contain environmentally sensitive lands:

íiü In no case shall the maximum permitted floor

 

area

ratio be determined using more than 8,000 square

feet for the lot area; and

-PAGE 33 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(íiiì Forthe RS-1-1, RS-1-2, RS-1-3, RS-1-4RS-1-5,

RS-1-6, RS-1-7 base zones, the applicable floor

area ratio shall be determined in accordance with

Table 131-04J using the adusted lot area as

described in Sections 141.0302(d)(3)(A)(i) and

141.0302(d)(3)(A)(ii).

(B) Within a base zone that permits

 

multiple dwelling unit

development where the lot contains environmentaUy

sensitive lands, the maximumpermittedloor area ratio

shall be determined by using the area of the lot that does

not contain environmentally sensitive lands.

11 Total Maximum number of permitted ADUs and JADUs on single

dwellin unit lots. The total maximum number ofADUs and

JADUs 

that may be permitted on a lot within a base zone that

emúts single dwellin unit development but not multiple dwelling

unit developmen4 shall be based on the lot area in accordance with

Table 141-03A. Ifthe lot contains

 

environmentally sensitive lands,

the lot area shall be determined using the area of the lot that does

not contain environmentally sensitive lands.

T

a

b

le 

1

4

1

-03

A

Maximum Number of Permitted ADUs and JADUs on Sinle

Dwellin Unit Lots

Lot Area

 Maximum Number 

of ADUs

(uare feet)

 

and JADUs

8,000 or less 

-PAGE 34 OF 46-



(O-2025-1

36 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

Lot Area

 

Maximum Number ofADUs

uare feet)

 

an

d J

A

D

Us

8,001 to 10,000 á

10,001 or greater á

1

The maximum number ofADUs and JADUs is inclusive of

 the total

number of ADUs and JADUs that are permitted in accordanc

e with

Se

cti

on

 14

1,0

30

2.

íá Fire Sprinklers. All affordable ADUs and bonus

 ADUs

 in the

development

 

shall include an automatic fire sprinkler system in

accordance with the California Building Standards Code.

íá Minimum Required OfStreet Parking Spaces. One o-street

parking space

 

shall be required for each affordable

 ADU and

bonus ADU located outside of a 

transit priority area.

£1 Landscape Requirements. Two trees shall be provided on the

premises for every 5,000 square feet of lot area, with a minimum

of one tree perpremises. Ifplanting of a new tree is required

 to

comply with this Section, the tre

e shall be selected in accordance

with the Landscape Standards of the Land Development Manual

and the City's Street Tree Selection Guide. If the

 

premises is

located in the OR Zone, the lot area used to determine the tree

requirement shall be based on the allowable

 

development

 

area as

described in Section 131.0250. If the premises contains

environmentaUy sensitive la

nds, the lot a

rea used to determine the

tree requirement shall be based on the allowable development area

as described

 in Chapter 14

, Article 3,

 Division 1.

-PA

GE 35 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

íâ ADUHome Density Bonus Agreement. The affordable ADUs shall

be guaranteed through a written agreement and a deed of trust

securing the agreement, entered into by the applicant and President

and Chief Executive Officer of the San Diego Housing

Commission, or their designee, prior to the issuance of a Building

Permit for the first affordable ADU or bonus ADU, whichever

occurs first, that meets the following requirements:

(A) A rental affordable ADU home density bonus agreement

shall utilize the following qualifying criteria:

ñ Very Low Income ADUHome Density

 Bonus. One

additional bonus ADU shall be permitted for every

affordable ADU on the 

premises

 that is set aside as

affordable to vey low income households for a

period of not less than 10 years at a rent that does

not exceed 30 percent of 50 percent of the area

median income as

 

adjusted for household size:

(i Low Income ADU Home Density

 

Bonus. One

additional bonus ADU shall be permitted for every

affordable ADU on the

 

premises

 that is set aside as

affordable to low income households for a period of

not less than 10 years at a rent that does not exceed

30 percent of 60 percent ofthe area median income

as adjusted for household size:

-PAGE 36 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(iii)

 

Moderate Income ADUHome Density

 

Bonus. One

additional bonus ADU shall be permitted for every

affordab

le ADU on the

 

premises

 

that is set aside as

affordable to moderate income households for a

period of not less than 15 years at a rent that does

not exceed 30 percent of 110 percent of the area

median income as adjusted for household size; and

íix

 

The very low income, low income, and moderate

income

 

affordable

 ADUs 

shall be comparable in

bedroom mix and amenities to the bonus ADUs in

the development.

(B) Violations. If the terms of the rental affordable ADUhome

density bonus agreement are violated by the

 

applicant. the

applicant

 

shall be liable for a minimum penalty of $10,000

er ADUper month, in addition to any fines outlined in the

rental affordable ADU home density bonus agreement with

the San Diego Housing Commission.

£21 ADUHome Density Bonus Program Community Enhancement

Fee. The applicant

 

shall pay an ADU Home Density Bonus

Program Community Enhancement Fee as established by San

Diego Resolution, ca

lculated based on the ro

ss/oor area of

 the

affordable ADUs and 

bonus ADUs. except that the

 

ross floor area

-PAGE 37 OF 46-



(O-202

5-136

 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

of any affor

dable

 ADUs tha

t meet al

l the f

ollowing shal

l not

 be

inc

luded

 in the 

cal

culat

ion:

(A) 

The affo

rdabl

e ADU is 

deed restr

icted to ve

y low inco

me

or low

 incom

e

 households in accordance with Section

141.0302(d)(8)

(A)(i) or

 141.0302

(d)(8)(A

ii); and

(B

) 

Th

e

 

pre

mise

s is

 

located

 in an area

 identifie

d as a High or

Very High Resource

 Califor

nia Tax C

redit

 Alloca

tion

Committee (C

TCAC) Opport

unity 

Area when the

develo

pment appl

ication is dee

med complete.

íl ADU Bonus for A

ccessi

ble ADUs. For 

develop

ment uti

lizing

 the AD U

Home Density

 Bonus Prog

ram in accor

dance

 with Sectio

n 141.0302

(d),a

maximum of one add

itional 

accessi

ble ADU shall be 

permitted if

 the

development

 

includes:

£1 

At least 

two ADUs tha

t are a

fforda

ble to

 very low

 incom

e, lo

w

incom

e, or m

oderat

e inco

me

 

hou

seho

lds

; an

d

1 The access

ible ADU meets the fo

llowing:

(A) Accessibil

ity requirem

ents in Chapter 1

1 A ofthe Californi

a

Building Code, inc

luding at least 

one acce

ssible bathroom

,

one ac

cessib

le kitc

hen, and

 one ac

cessib

le

 

bedroom

(Bì 

The acc

essib

le ADU shall 

be loca

ted on an

 acce

ssible r

oute

as def

ined by the Califo

rnia B

uildin

g Code; 

and

(Cì The acc

essible ADU shall be

 comparable 

in bedr

oom mix

and amenities to the

 bonus

 

ADUs in the development.

-PAGE 38 OF 46

-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

íf Sale or Conveyance ofADUs. New or existing.ADUs may be converted

into condominiums and shall be sold or otherwise conveyed separately

from the primary residence in accordance with this Section or pursuant to

Section 141.0302(g) and subject to all the following:

£11 All structures and buildings included as part of a condominium

development

 

shall conform to the requirements applicable to the

base zone or planned district in which the

 

development is

 located.

Designation of individual condominium units shall not be deemed

to reduce or eliminate any of the base zone or planned district

requirements applicable to the buildings or

 

structures.

 

Unless

otherwise allowed

 

for ADUs 

pursuant to Section 141.0302(b):

(A) The condominium subdivision shall be created pursuant to

the Davis-Stirling Common Interest Development Act Part

5 (commencing with section 4000) of Division 4 of the

California Civil Code);

3) The condominium subdivision shall be created in

conformance with the

 

Subdivision Map Act

 

(Division 2

(commencing with California Government Code section

66410)

Cì Neither a subdivision map nor a condominium plan shall be

recorded without each lienholder's written consent. The

following shall apply to the consent of a lienholder:

íiì A lienholder may refuse to give written consent; or

-PAGE 39 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

íi 

A lienholder may consent provided that any terms

and conditions required by the lienholder are

satisfied:

(D) Prior to recordation of the initial or any subsequent

modifications to the condominium plan, written evidence of

the lienholder's consent shall be provided to the Office of

the County Recorder of San Diego County along with a

signed statement from each lienholder that states the

following: "(Name of lienholder) hereby consents to the

recording of this condominium plan in their sole and

absolute discretion and the borrower has or will satisfy any

additional terms and conditions the lienholder may have.":

(E) The lienholder's written consent shall be included on the

condominium plan, or attached to the condominium plan

that includes the following information:

íil 

The lienholder's signature;

íii The name of the record owner or ground lessee;

(iii) The legal description of the real property:

0

 

The identities of all parties with an interest in the

real property as reflected in the real property

records; and

-PAGE 40 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

íx 

The lienholder's written consent shall be recorded

in the Office of the County Recorder o f San Diego

Count.

 The condominium

 

development

 

shall be subject to the Subdivision

requirements in Chapter 12, Article 5.

1 The condominium

 

development

 

shall be subject to the

Condominium Conversion Regulations in Chapter 14, Article 4.

Division 5 if any of the ADUs in the development were occupied.

íá If an ADUis established as a condominium, the

 

applicant

 shall

notify providers of utilities, including water, sewer, gas, and

electricity, of the condominium creation and separate conveyance.

íl The condominium

 

development

 

shall be located on a single parcel

or lot 

that was previously mapped and monumented in a manner

satisfactory to the City Engineer in accordance with Subdivision

Map Act Section 66428(b).

1 For a minimum period of 30 days from the date

 

an ADU 

that is

established as a condominium is first listed for sale, the

 

record

owner

 

shall offer the ADU through at least two publicly accessible

real estate websites or databases with a disclosure stating that the

ADU is being offered for at least 30 days to buyers intending to use

the ADUas their primary residence.

£ 

ADUs that have received financing or other forms of assistance

from the San Diego Housing Commission shall not be converted

-PAGE 41 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

into condominiums and shall not be sold or otherwise conveyed

separately from the primary residence during the term specified in

the deed restriction agreement for the duration of the deed

restriction or affordability covenant term.

íål Rental ADUs that are rent restricted by law or covenant to persons

and families of very low income, low income, or

 moderate income

shall not be converted into condominiums and shall not be sold or

otherwise conveyed separately from the primary residence for the

duration of the deed restriction or affordability covenant term.

ígl Sale or Conveyance ofanADUbya nonprofit corporation.

£1 An ADUmay besold or conveyed separately from the primary

dwelling unit by a qualified nonprofit corporation.

2 For the purpose of Section 141.0302(g), a qualified nonprofit

corporation means a nonprofit corporation organized pursuant to

Section 501(c)(3) ofthe Internal Revenue Code that has received a

welfare exemption under the California Revenue and Taxation

Code section 214.15 for properties intended to be sold to

low-income

 

families who participate in a special no-interest loan

program

.

í For an ADUto be sold or conveyed separately from the primary

dwelling unit by a

 

qualified nonprofit corporation, the following

shall apply:

-PAGE 42 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(A) There is an enforceable restriction on the use of the

premises on which the ADU is located pursuant to a

recorded a

greement between the qual

ified buyer a

nd the

qualified nonprofit corporation. For the purposes of Section

141.0302(g)(3)(A), a qualifie

d buyer means very low

income, low income, median income, or moderate income

households, as specified below:

(1 Very low income ADUs

 

shall be affordable to vey

low income

 

households at an affordable housing

cost that does not exceed 30 percent of 50 percent

of the area median income, as adjusted for

household size, appropriate for the ADU

(i Low income ADUs shall be affordable

 

to low

income

 

households at an affordable housing cost

that does not exceed 30 percent of 70 percent ofthe

area median income, as adiusted for household size,

appropriate for the AD

(iii)

 Moderate income ADUs shall be affordable to

moderate income

 

households at a housing cost that

does not exceed 35 of 110 percent ofthe area

median income, as adiusted for household size,

appropriate for the ADU

-PAGE 43 OF 46-



(O-2025-1

36 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(B) The lot where the ADU is located is held pursuant to a

recorded tenancy in common agreement that includes:

íil An allocation to each qualified buyer of an

undivided, unequal interest in the lot based on the

size of the ADUeach qualified buyer occupies;

íiiì A repurchase option that requires the qualified

buyer to first offer the qualified nonprofit

corporation to buy the property if the buyer desires

to sell or convey the property:

(ii A requirement that the qualified buyer occupy the

property as the qualified buyer's principal

residence; and

íix

 

Affordability restrictions on the sale and

conveyance of the property that ensure the property

will be 

preserved for very low income, low income,

median income, or moderate income

 households for

45 years for owner-occupied housing and will be

sold or resold to a qualified buyer.

(C A grant deed naming the grantor, grantee, and describing

the property interests being transferred shall be recorded in

the Office ofthe Recorder in San Diego County.

-PAGE 44 OF 46-



(O-202

5-136

 REV.)

(COR. COPY

)

(D) A Prelim

inary Change

 of Ownershi

p Repor

t shall be

 filed

concurre

ntly with the gr

ant deed

 pursuan

t to the 

Califor

nia

Revenue 

and Taxation Code sect

ion 480.3.

E) If requested by a utility providing service to the primary

residen

ce, the ADUhas a

 separate 

water, sew

er, or

electrical co

nnection to that utility.

§143.0815

 

When Coastal Overlay Zone Affordable

 Housing Replace

ment Regulat

ions

Apply

(a) [No change in

 text.]

(b) The follo

wing developm

ent types

 shall be

 reviewed for com

pliance

 with

the reg

ulation

s in this D

ivision:

(1) Conversion f

rom rental un

its or Acces

soy Dwelling Units to

condominium

 units (coo

perative

 or similar fo

rm ofownership);

(2) throug

h (3) [No chang

e in text.]

(c) [No change in text.]

§144.0501

 

Purpose 

of Condom

inium Convers

ion Regula

tions

The purpo

se of the Condominium Conversion Regulations is to

 allow the

convers

ion of apartments and

 Accessoy Dwelling Units to

 condominiums while

protectin

g the inter

ests of tenant

s by requiring that ten

ants receive

 adequ

ate not

ice

of propos

ed condom

inium conver

sions, are

 advised

 of their 

rights with respect to

the con

version

 of their ap

artment or A

ccessoy Dwelling

 Unit to

 a con

dominium

,

and are

 afforded reason

able reloc

ation a

ssistance

. It is al

so the inte

nt of these

regulati

ons to protec

t the in

terests 

of the 

community and pros

pective 

purcha

sers

by requiri

ng the app

licant

 to provi

de certai

n infor

mation regardi

ng the con

dition

-PAGE 45 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

ofthe

 structure and to 

require reasonable improvements for the health, safety, and

general welfare of the public.

CLN:cm:jn2:amt:cm:jn2

March 12, 2025

June 13, 2025 COR. COPY

June 17, 2025 REV.

Or.Dept: City Planning

Doc. No. 4082425_3

-PAGE 46 OF 46-



Passed bythe Council of The City of San Diego on

 

JUL 22 2025 ,

 

by the following vote:

Councilmembers

 Yeas

 

N

ays

 

Not Present

 

Recused

Joe LaCava

Jennifer Campbell

Stephen Whitburn

Henry L. Foster Ill

Marni von Wilpert

Kent Lee

Raul A. Campillo

Vivian Moreno

Sean Elo-Rivera

í_

1-

 

L

 

-

-

 3

 3

 

3 3

3

2 

JU

L 2

 3

 2

025

Date of final passage

AUTHENTICATED BY:

TODD GLORIA

Mayor of The City of San Diego, California.

(Seal)

DIANAJ.S. FUENTES

City Clerk of The City of San Diego, California.

y 

-

U

 ò

l

k

1.

-

, D

ep

uty

1 HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally passed until twelve calendar

days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final passage, to wit, on

JUN 1 0 2025 ,

 and on

 JUL 2 3 2025

1 FURTHER CERTIFY that said ordinance was read in full prior to passage or that such

reading was dispensed with by a vote of five members of the Council, and that a written copy of

the ordinance was made available to each member of the Council and the public prior to the day

of its passage.

(Seal)

DIANAJ.S. FUENTES

City Clerk of The City pf San Diego, California.

  .

By . 7 *U- , Deputy

Office of the City Clerk, San Diego, California

Ordinance Number 0-

 

21989


